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’Our Focus Is Commitment To Your Focus’ 

 

RONALD CHARLES BUFORD is a native of Saint Paul and has lived most of his life in the 
Rondo Community.  Ronald attended Purdue University, where he pledged Kappa Alpha Psi 
fraternity, has a degree in Accounting and worked for Ameriprise Financial for 11 years as a 
Mutual Funds Operations Manager, Project Manager and Business Analyst, post-graduation. 
Upon his transition from the corporate arena to full time entrepreneurship, Ronald has directly 
and indirectly contributed to the Twin Cities community and business efforts through numerous 
endeavors. He is the owner and operator of PR3 eNteprises, LLC – a small but growing 
Technology, Business & Entertainment Solutions business – that provides consultation and direct 
service applications to business and individuals. Ronald has been involved with the Rondo Days 
Celebration & Rondo Avenue, Inc. as a food vendor, several years as a board member and the 
last 2 years of his involvement as President.  He has contracted with KMOJ Radio as an 
underwriter and Social Media SME for 3 years and has worked closely with several community-
based organizations such as Hallie Q Brown, Aurora St. Anthony Development Corp, Rondo 
Arts & Cultural Business District Project, and the Friendly Streets Initiative. 

Ronald’s most recent efforts and focus over the last few years is managing the responsibilities as 
Director of Business Development for Osiris Organization, a non-profit business that provides 
access to technology, computer training and life-skills coaching that help youth and adults build 
the knowledge, skills and behaviors they need to achieve personal and career success.  He is also 
the co-creator and moderator of the Buy Back Twin Cities Group (BBTCG) social media 
platforms that allow Black businesses to share their product and service promotions to the 
BBTCG followers.  Plans for the BBTCG are to provide entrepreneurial business education and 
training that ultimately leads to stronger business acumen to its members that need the guidance 
and direction. 

Ronald’s visions and commitment to excellence is accredited his collegiate and corporate 
background, and his experiences working with like-minded professionals and community 
organizations.  He has established many friendships and business relationships that have kept 
him relevant in the Twin Cities Metro area where he continues to strive for a better community, 
city, and state for which we live.  He is honored to contribute his knowledge, experience, and 
business relationships as a member of the Board for the BOB Rewards Club. 
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